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WEST VIRGINIA CODE: §51-4-3
§51-4-3. Preservation and destruction of papers; microphotography and electronic
storage.

All papers lawfully returned to or filed in the clerk's office shall be preserved therein, subject
to the conditions set out herein, until legally delivered out.

Notwithstanding any other provision of this code to the contrary, the clerk may destroy all
documents, records, instruments, books, papers, depositions and transcripts in any action or
proceeding in the circuit court or other court of record, or otherwise filed in his office
pursuant to law, provided that:

(a) Destruction is done in accordance with a "Record Retention Schedule" to be adopted,
promulgated and amended, from time to time, by the Supreme Court of Appeals; and

(b) The clerk maintains for the use of the public a microphotographic film or electronic
storage media record of all documents required to be permanently preserved under the
"Record Retention Schedule," together with an index and a mechanical or electronic device
by which such microphotographic film or electronic storage media record may be
conveniently examined. The clerk shall promptly seal and store at least one original of each
microphotographic film or electronic storage media record in such manner and place as will
reasonably assure its preservation indefinitely against loss, theft, defacement, intentional
alteration, fire or other destruction. Any electronic method used must provide an exact copy
of each document so stored and must be secure to the point that an attempt to alter a
document is readily recognized.

A photographic reproduction or electronic media reproduction of any of the records
described in this section, the negative or film or electronic record of which has been
certified by the clerk in charge of such reproduction as being an exact replica of the original,
shall be received in evidence in all courts, and in hearings before any officer, board or
commission having jurisdiction or authority to conduct such hearings, in like manner as the
original. WV Le
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